
 

 

  
						

April	2025	Invoice	
MPS	&	ASSOCIATES,	LLC	



 

 

Invoice #10 – April 2025 
 
Contract: 
#30008888 
Effective July 1, 2024 
 
Contractor: 
MPS & Associates, LLC 
2108 N St, Ste N 
Sacramento, CA 95816 
 
Invoice Date: 
May 15, 2025 
 
Remit payment to: 
Mark P. Smith, Lead Monitor 
[Phone number is on file] 
  



 

 

Invoice Summary 
 

Breakdown of Invoice by Team Member 

Team Member Hours 
Billed 

Hourly 
Rate 

Amount 
Billed 

Reimbursable 
Expenses 

Total 
Invoiced 

Mark P. Smith, Lead Monitor 
-MPS & Associates, LLC 122.9 $375 $46,087.50 $1,864.71 $47,952.21 

Russell G. Bloom, Deputy Monitor 65.15 $325 $21,173.75 $1,234.74 $22,408.49 

Brian Buchner, Associate Monitor 
-BRB Consulting, LLC - $250 - - - 

Antoinette Edwards, Associate 
Monitor 
-Edwards Consulting 

11.5 $250 $2,875.00 - $2,875.00 

Robert Fornango, Associate 
Monitor 
-F1 Analytics, LLC 

45.9 $250 $11,475.00 - $11,475.00 

Cori Lowe, Associate Monitor 
-Cori Lowe Consulting, LLC 9 $250 $2,250.00 - $2,250.00 

Che Ramirez, Associate Monitor 
-Community Homelessness 
Expertise (CHE) LLC 

58.2 $250 $14,550.00 $3,295.85 $17,845.85 

Susruta Sudula, Associate 
Monitor 22.5 $250 $5,625.00 - $5,625.00 

Valencia Thomas, Associate 
Monitor 18.1 $250 $4,525.00 - $4,525.00 

Aggregated Totals 

 353.25  $108,561.25 $6,395.30 $114,956.55 

 

 
 
 

Running Totals 

Total amount invoiced during first year of Monitor’s term, up to and including current invoice $1,024,288.53 

Total not-to-exceed amount for first year of Monitor’s term $1,075,400.00 



 

 

Team Member Invoices 
 
Following this page are invoices from each team member, which include brief descriptions of 
services provided, hours spent providing such services during each day of the invoice period, 
and receipts for reimbursable expenses as required. 
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Mark P Smith's Workspace 1

Mark P. Smith - April 2025
Invoice 
04/01/2025 - 04/30/2025 

Total: 147.10 Billable: 122.90

Date Description Duration

04/01/2025 Review compliance materials from City; Draft compliance report

 - [Par. 220, Par. 226]

6.50

04/01/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

2.50

04/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

04/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.80

04/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.50

04/02/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.60

04/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.20

04/02/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

1.30

04/03/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/03/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

0.20

04/03/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

04/03/2025 Review of PPB training materials

 - [Par. 246]

1.10



Mark P Smith's Workspace              2

04/03/2025 Meeting with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

1.00

04/03/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

1.00

04/03/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

04/03/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.40

04/03/2025 Communication with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.60

04/03/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

0.90

04/03/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

0.80

04/04/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.80

04/04/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.30

04/04/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.10

04/06/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.20

04/07/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

1.30

04/07/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.50

04/07/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.30

04/07/2025 Refine outcome assessment methodologies

 - [Par. 224]

0.60

04/07/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.50

04/07/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.50



Mark P Smith's Workspace 3

04/07/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

04/07/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.30

04/07/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

04/08/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.90

04/08/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.70

04/08/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.00

04/08/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.40

04/08/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.70

04/08/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

3.50

04/09/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.20

04/09/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.20

04/09/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.70

04/09/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 230, Par. 231]

0.50

04/09/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.20

04/10/2025 Observe PPB training

 - [Par. 84]

4.30

04/10/2025 Observe PPB training

 - [Par. 84]

3.40

04/11/2025 Observe PPB training

 - [Par. 84]

3.00



Mark P Smith's Workspace 4

04/11/2025 Observe PPB training

 - [Par. 84]

3.50

04/11/2025 Review PPB policies

 - [Par. 243]

0.30

04/13/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

1.50

04/13/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.30

04/13/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

1.00

04/14/2025 Meeting with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

1.10

04/14/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.60

04/14/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.10

04/14/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.50

04/14/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.30

04/14/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

04/14/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.80

04/14/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

04/14/2025 Review of PPB training materials

 - [Par. 246]

0.50

04/14/2025 Review of PPB training materials

 - [Par. 246]

1.80

04/15/2025 Review PPB policies

 - [Par. 243]

1.00

04/15/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.40



Mark P Smith's Workspace 5

04/15/2025 Meeting with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

1.00

04/15/2025 Meeting with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

0.90

04/15/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/15/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

0.50

04/15/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

1.90

04/15/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

1.10

04/15/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

2.90

04/16/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

1.30

04/16/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.20

04/16/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

0.60

04/16/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

0.70

04/16/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

0.60

04/16/2025 Evaluation of City's self-monitoring report

 - [Par. 256]

4.00

04/17/2025 Meeting with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.50

04/17/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.50

04/17/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

1.20

04/17/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.20



Mark P Smith's Workspace 6

04/17/2025 Attend Behavioral Health Unit Advisory Committee Meeting

 - [Par. 94, Par. 95, Par. 96]

1.00

04/18/2025 Meeting with PCCEP; planning for Town Hall

 - [Par. 230, Par. 231]

1.70

04/21/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.80

04/21/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.00

04/21/2025 Meeting with PCCEP; planning for Town Hall

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.40

04/22/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

1.00

04/22/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/22/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.60

04/22/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

2.00

04/22/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.70

04/22/2025 Review DOJ comments on compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

04/22/2025 Review DOJ comments on compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.00

04/22/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.30

04/23/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.50

04/23/2025 Review PPB policies

 - [Par. 243]

0.90

04/23/2025 Review of PPB training materials

 - [Par. 246]

0.30

04/23/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.50



Mark P Smith's Workspace 7

04/23/2025 Review PPB policies

 - [Par. 243]

1.00

04/23/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.60

04/23/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.40

04/24/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

1.60

04/24/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/24/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.50

04/24/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.50

04/24/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.40

04/24/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

1.30

04/24/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.80

04/25/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.80

04/25/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.60

04/27/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.40

04/27/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.40

04/27/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

2.10

04/28/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

0.80

04/28/2025 Review compliance materials from City

 - [Par. 220]

0.20



Mark P Smith's Workspace 8

04/28/2025 Preparation for town hall; Community engagement and feedback

 - [Par. 231, Par. 230]

1.30

04/28/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.60

04/28/2025 Prepare quarterly statements

 - [Par. 211]

0.80

04/28/2025 Review compliance materials from City; Draft compliance report

 - [Par. 220, Par. 226]

0.50

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.80

04/29/2025 Review materials for PRB

 - [Par. 131]

1.50

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

04/29/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.10

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.30

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.20

04/29/2025 Preparation for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.50

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.90

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

04/29/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.80

04/30/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

2.10

04/30/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.80

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.60



Mark P Smith's Workspace 9

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

04/30/2025 Meeting with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.40

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.60

04/30/2025 Meeting with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

1.60

04/30/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.70

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.60

04/30/2025 Revise compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

5.70
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Romel C. Diaz 
Website Design & Maintenance 

 
 

 

INVOICE 

INVOICE #PPM-0006 
DATE: 04/01/25 

TO: 
MPS & Associates, LLC 
2108 N St., STE N 
Sacramento, CA 95816 USA 
Email: info@portlandpolicemonitor.com 

FOR: 
Website Development, Maintenance, & Technical 
Support 
 

DESCRIPTION HOURS/QTY RATE AMOUNT 
Care Plan / Website Maintenance for April 2025: 
portlandpolicemonitor.com 

Lump Sum   $200.00 

 
  
 

 
 

 
 

  

    
TOTAL (NET AFTER ALL FEES)  $200.00 

 
 
Make all payments to: 
 
 

  
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

Thank you for your business! 



Today's Date:
Name:
Destination City/State:
Travel Dates - Departure: Wednesday, April 9, 2025 Return Date:

NOTES

4/9 - 4/12: LAX to PDX, Roundtrip $407.97

4/9: Rideshare - Home to airport $46.68

4/9: Rideshare - Airport to hotel $47.69

4/10: Rideshare - Hotel to training division (multiple team members) $32.27

$39.56

4/11: Rideshare - Hotel to training division (multiple team members) $37.19

4/11: Rideshare - Training division to hotel (multiple team members) $41.60

4/12: Rideshare - Hotel to airport $53.68

$657.07

First Day $64.50 $64.50

Full days are $86
4/10 $86.00

4/11 $86.00

Last Day $64.50 $64.50

$1,664.71

Consultant

Project Manager

Saturday, April 12, 2025
Purpose of trip: Trial and Site Visit

MEALS & INCIDENTAL EXPENSES PER DIEM - LIST BY DATE

Signature

Approvals

OTHER (List Each Category below)

Portland, OR

Total Expenses Submitted to be Reimbursed

 Expense 
Amount

EXPENSES

City of Portland Travel Authorization/Expense Report

LODGING

Per Diem Rates | GSA
FOR BUREAU USE ONLY

Submit copies of all expenses requesting reimbursement for except for M&IE per diem

TRANSPORTATION EXPENSE

4/12/25
Mark P. Smith

4/10: Rideshare - Training division to hotel (multiple team members)





Check your flight information online at delta.com or call the Delta Flightline at 800.325.1999.

Baggage and check-in requirements vary by airport and airline, so please check with the
operating carrier on your ticket.

Please review Delta's  check-in requirements  and  baggage guidelines for details.

You must be checked in and at the gate at least 15 minutes before your scheduled departure
time for travel inside the United States.

You must be checked in and at the gate at least 45 minutes before your scheduled departure
time for international travel.

For tips on flying safely with laptops, cell phones, and other battery-powered devices, please visit
Flying safely government guild.

Do you have comments about service? Please  email  us to share them.

NON-REFUNDABLE / CHANGE FEE

When using certain vouchers to purchase tickets, remaining credits may not be refunded.
Additional charges and/or credits may apply and are displayed in the sections below.

This ticket is non-refundable unless issued at a fully refundable fare. Any change to your itinerary
may require payment of a change fee and increased fare. Failure to appear for any flight without
notice to Delta will result in cancellation of your remaining reservation.

All Preferred, Delta Comfort+™, First Class, and Delta One seat purchases are Nonrefundable.

Terms & Conditions
Air transportation on Delta and the Delta Connection® carriers is subject to Delta's  conditions of
carriage.    They include terms governing for example:

-  Limits on our liability  for personal injury or death of passengers, and for loss, damage of delay
of goods and baggage.
-  Claim restrictions  including time periods within which you must file a claim or bring action
against us.
- Our right to  change terms  of the contract.
-  Check-in requirements  and other rules established when we may  refuse carriage.
- Our rights and limits of our liability for  delay of failure to perform service  , including schedule
change, substitution of alternative air carriers or aircraft, and rerouting.
- Our policy on  overbooking flights  , and your rights if we deny you boarding due to an oversold
flight.

These terms are incorporated by reference into our contract with you. You may view these
conditions of carriage on delta.com, or by requesting a copy from Delta.

You have received this email because you elected to receive your Electronic Ticket receipt sent
to you via email. If you would like to take advantage of other Delta email programs featuring
special fare, promotions, information and flight updates, please visit Delta News & Special Offers
or Delta notifications.



COPYRIGHT INFORMATION

This email message and its contents are copyrighted and are proprietary products of Delta
Air Lines, Inc. Delta Blvd. P.O. Box 20706 Atlanta, GA 30320-6001. Any unauthorized use,
reproduction, or transfer of this message or its contents, in any medium, is strictly prohibited.

© 2025 Delta Air Lines, Inc. All rights reserved.





Pickup   11:34 AM
 

Drop-off  12:04 PM
  6600 World Way, Los Angeles, CA

Favorite driver

Tip driver

Find lost item



Request review

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

Help Center

Receipt #2069828428176557764
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   3:43 PM
  7100 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Drop-off  4:24 PM
  536 SW Broadway, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item

Request review



To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2069891419926583822
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   6:24 AM
  588 SW Broadway, Portland, OR

Stop  6:28 AM
  1375 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR

Drop-off  6:45 AM
  14912 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item



Request review

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2070119694980830654
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   4:02 PM
  14912 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Stop  4:47 PM
  222 SW Columbia St, Portland, OR

Drop-off  4:53 PM
  520 SW Broadway, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item



Request review

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2070267020759831972
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   6:23 AM
  210 SW Morgan Bldg St, Portland, OR

Stop  6:29 AM
  1316 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR

Drop-off  6:46 AM
  14912 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item



Request review

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2070490911915327648
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   4:20 PM
  14912 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Stop  4:46 PM
  1316 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR

Drop-off  4:54 PM
  627 SW Washington St, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item



Request review

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2070642138053555828
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver





Pickup   11:31 AM
  522 SW Broadway, Portland, OR

Drop-off  11:48 AM
  NE Airport Way, Portland, OR

Tip driver

Find lost item

Request review



To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your bank
statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.

Help Center

Receipt #2070941091843855844
We never share your address with your driver after a ride.

Learn more about our commitment to safety.

© OpenStreetMap

© 2025 Lyft, Inc.
548 Market St., P.O. Box 68514

San Francisco, CA 94104
CPUC ID No. TCP0032513 - P

Work at Lyft
Become a Driver



"" 
THE BIDWELL PORTLAND MARRIOTT 

■ SMITH/M 135.00 04/12/25 
ROOM NAME RATE DEPART 

NKNG 04/09/25 
TYPE ARRIVE 

14 

ROOM 
ADDRESS 

CLERK 
PAYMENT 

DATE REFERENCES CHARGES 

04/09 DEST FEE DEST FEE 30.00 
04/09 ROOM TAX DEST FEE 3.90 
04/09 CITY FEE DEST FEE .90 
04/09 CAT TAX DEST FEE .17 
04/09 ROOM 705, 1 222.00 
04/09 ROOM TAX 705, 1 28.86 
04/09 CITY FEE 705, 1 6.66 
04/09 CAT TAX 705 1 1.27 
04/10 DEST FEE DEStFEE 30.00 
04/10 ROOM TAX DEST FEE 3.90 
04/10 CITY FEE DEST FEE .90 
04/10 CAT TAX DEST FEE .17 
04/10 ROOM 705, 1 169.00 
04/10 ROOM TAX 705, 1 21.97 
04/10 CITY FEE 705, 1 5.07 
04/10 CAT TAX 705 1 .96 
04/11 DEST FEE DEStFEE 30.00 
04/11 ROOM TAX DEST FEE 3.90 
04/11 CITY FEE DEST FEE .90 
04/11 CAT TAX DEST FEE .17 
04/11 ROOM 705, 1 135.00 
04/11 ROOM TAX 705, 1 17.55 
04/11 CITY FEE 705, 1 4.05 
04/11 CAT TAX 705, 1 .77 
04/12 VS CARD 

TO BE SETTLED TO: VISA 

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT, 
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK

i--
OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR 

TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCE;,S VIDEO CHECK-OUT 

12:00 
TIME 

16:27 
TIME 

CREDITS 

$718.07

- $61.00
-------------
$657.07

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com 

GUEST FOLIO 

MBV#: ><XXX9 

BALANCES DUE 

Your Marriott Bonvoy points/miles earned on your eligible earnings will be credited to your account. Check your 
Marriott Bonvoy Account Statement for updated activity. See members.marriott.com for new Marriott Bonvoy 
benefits. 

MARRIOTT 

THE BIDWELL PORTLAND 
520 S. W. BROADWAY 
PORTLAND OR 97205 
503-226-6300 

Treat yourself to the comfort of Marriott Hotels in your home. Visit ShopMarriott.com. 

This statement is your only receipt. You have agreed 10 pay in cash ot by approved personal check or to authorize us to charg,e your credt card fa< al amounts charg,ed to you. The amounts shown in ihe credit coiull'Wl opposite any etedit card 
entry in the reference collmn above will be charged to the credit card number set forth above. (The crecit card company will biU in the usual manner.) tf for any reason the credit card ccmpany does not make payment on this aooounl you wil 
owe us such amount. If you are dnct biOed. in the event payment is not made within 25days afte<chedt-out. you will owe us interest from the check-<>ut date on any Ul1)aid amount at the rate of 1.5'6 per month (ANNUAL RATE 18%), or the 
maximum aDowed by law. plus the reasonable cost d coflection, including attorney fees. 

Sign.atu.re X 

OPERATED UNDER LICENSE FROM MARRIOTT IN TERNATK>NAL. INC. OR ONE OF ITS AFFILIATES 

Booking rate for hotel was $175 per night 
(Average of $222 + $169 + $135 = 
$175.33). Reimbursement request is $61 
less than the total hotel charge, in order to 
account for the $20.33 overage beyond the 
applicable GSA Rate ($155) per night 
($20.33 x 3 nights = $61).

Mark Smith
Highlight

Mark Smith
Highlight



Russell G. Bloom: Portland10              1

Russell G. Bloom: Portland10
Issue date: 05/07/2025

Due date: 06/06/2025

Bill from Bill to

Russell Bloom MPS & Associates

[Address Redacted]

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

04/01/2025 - Semiannual report (All paras.) 1.40 USD 325.00 USD 455.00

04/01/2025 - Semiannual report (All paras.) 1.80 USD 325.00 USD 585.00

04/02/2025 - Data submissions to PPB (Paras 121, 122) 0.30 USD 325.00 USD 97.50

04/02/2025 - Outcome Assessments meeting prep (All paras) 0.40 USD 325.00 USD 130.00

04/03/2025 - Outcome Assessments meeting (Paras 222, 251) 1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/03/2025 - Team Discussion re Outcome Assessments

(Paras 222, 251)

1.50 USD 325.00 USD 487.50

04/04/2025 - Semiannual report (Para. 123) 1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/07/2025 - Meeting re BOEC Assessment (Para. 115) 0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

04/08/2025 - Meeting re civilian oversight system (Para. 195) 0.80 USD 325.00 USD 260.00

04/10/2025 - PPB In-service training observation (Paras. 78-

87)

3.40 USD 325.00 USD 1,105.00

04/10/2025 - PPB In-service training observation (Paras. 78-

87)

4.20 USD 325.00 USD 1,365.00

04/11/2025 - PPB In-service training observation (Paras. 78-

87)

3.00 USD 325.00 USD 975.00

04/11/2025 - PPB In-service training observation (Para. 78-87) 3.50 USD 325.00 USD 1,137.50

04/13/2025 - CE Team Town Hall planning meeting (Paras.

227, 230, 231)

1.50 USD 325.00 USD 487.50

04/14/2025 - Meeting with DOJ (All paras.) 0.20 USD 325.00 USD 65.00

04/14/2025 - Meeting with PPB (Paras. 121-123) 0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

04/14/2025 - Meeting with PPB and Parties re Draft

Semiannual Report (All paras.)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00



Russell G. Bloom: Portland10              2

04/14/2025 - PPB Self-Monitoring Report Review (Para. 249) 2.10 USD 325.00 USD 682.50

04/14/2025 - PPB Self-Monitoring Report Review (Para. 249) 1.80 USD 325.00 USD 585.00

04/15/2025 - City's Self-Monitoring Report Review (Paras 141-

144, 151, 152, 249)

4.40 USD 325.00 USD 1,430.00

04/15/2025 - Meeting with IPR (Paras 121-123) 1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/15/2025 - Meeting with PPB/City re Semiannual Report (all

paras)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/15/2025 - PPB Self-Monitoring Report Review (Para. 249) 1.80 USD 325.00 USD 585.00

04/15/2025 - PPB Self-Monitoring Report Review (Para. 249) 1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/15/2025 - PPB Self-Monitoring Report Review (Para. 249) 1.10 USD 325.00 USD 357.50

04/17/2025 - Meeting with PPB/City re Semiannual Report (All

paras.)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

04/18/2025 - CE Team Town Hall planning meeting (Paras.

227, 230, 231)

0.40 USD 325.00 USD 130.00

04/18/2025 - Meeting with PCCEP re Town Hall planning

meeting/Debrief (Paras. 227, 230, 231)

1.60 USD 325.00 USD 520.00

04/22/2025 - Meeting re DOJ comments on Draft Semiannual

Report (All paras)

2.00 USD 325.00 USD 650.00

04/24/2025 - Meeting with Councilor (Para 231) 0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

04/24/2025 - Semiannual Report updates (All paras) 1.20 USD 325.00 USD 390.00

04/28/2025 - CE Team Town Hall planning meeting (Paras.

227, 230, 231)

1.20 USD 325.00 USD 390.00

04/28/2025 - Meeting with PCCEP re Town Hall (Para. 231) 0.75 USD 325.00 USD 243.75

04/29/2025 - Meeting with MAC (Para. 231) 1.10 USD 325.00 USD 357.50

04/29/2025 - Semiannual Report updates (All paras.) 3.00 USD 325.00 USD 975.00

04/30/2025 - MPS Team meeting (All paras.) 1.30 USD 325.00 USD 422.50

04/30/2025 - Meeting re Semiannual report and PPB Self-

Assessment (All paras.)

0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

04/30/2025 - Meeting with City (All paras.) 0.35 USD 325.00 USD 113.75

04/30/2025 - Meeting with City/DOJ re Semiannual Report (All

paras.)

1.75 USD 325.00 USD 568.75

04/30/2025 - Self-monitoring report review (Para. 249) 1.20 USD 325.00 USD 390.00

04/30/2025 - Semiannual Report updates (All paras.) 5.10 USD 325.00 USD 1,657.50

04/30/2025 - Semiannual Report updates (All paras.) 1.25 USD 325.00 USD 406.25
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04/30/2025 - Semiannual Report updates (All paras.) 0.75 USD 325.00 USD 243.75

SUBTOTAL USD 21,173.75

TOTAL USD 21,173.75









American Express ••••
4/12/25 8:41 AM

American Express ••••
4/12/25 8:48 AM

8:24 AM | 1355 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR 97201, US

8:40 AM | 7000 NE Airport Way, Portland, OR 97218, US

UberX     12.44 miles | 16
min

April 12, 2025

Thanks for tipping, Russell
Here's your updated Saturday morning ride receipt.

Total $47.98

Trip fare $22.71

Subtotal $22.71

City of Portland Surcharge $0.65

Booking Fee $2.85

Reservation Fee $8.66

Portland Accessibility Fee $0.11

Airport Surcharge $4.00

Tip $9.00

Payments

$38.98

$9.00

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with Stephen

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



American Express ••••
4/12/25 1:27 PM

American Express ••••
4/12/25 1:33 PM

12:55 PM | Terminal 2, Oakland International Airport (OAK), Oakland, CA 94621, US

1:27 PM | San Pablo, CA 94806-2713, US

UberX     24.41 miles | 32
min

April 12, 2025

Thanks for tipping, Russell
Here's your updated Saturday afternoon ride receipt.

Total $75.21

Trip fare $32.03

Reserve Premium $8.20

Subtotal $40.23

OAK Airport Pickup/Dropoff Surcharge $3.35

Tip $12.59

Access for All Fee $0.10

CA Driver Benefits $0.32

Booking Fee $18.53

Clean Miles Standard Regulatory Fee $0.09

Payments

$62.62

$12.59

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with CHIMEDREGZEN

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



American Express ••••
4/9/25 12:01 PM

American Express ••••
4/9/25 12:28 PM

11:27 AM |  San Pablo, CA 94806-2713, US

12:01 PM | 1 Airport Dr, Oakland, CA 94621, US

UberX     23.72 miles | 33
min

April 9, 2025

Thanks for tipping, Russell
Here's your updated Wednesday morning ride receipt.

Total $62.99

Trip fare $28.48

Reserve Premium $2.47

Subtotal $30.95

CA Driver Benefits $0.32

OAK Airport Pickup/Dropoff Surcharge $3.70

Access for All Fee $0.10

Booking Fee $14.83

Tip $13.00

Clean Miles Standard Regulatory Fee $0.09

Payments

$49.99

$13.00

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with WANLI

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



American Express ••••
4/9/25 4:13 PM

American Express ••••
4/11/25 3:30 PM

3:37 PM | Portland International Airport (PDX), Portland, OR 97218, US

4:13 PM | 1355 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR 97201, US

UberX     12.68 miles | 36
min

April 9, 2025

Thanks for tipping, Russell
Here's your updated Wednesday afternoon ride receipt.

Total $50.61

Time $13.65

Distance $14.02

Base Fare $1.42

Subtotal $29.09

City of Portland Surcharge $0.65

Reservation Fee $3.60

Portland Accessibility Fee $0.11

Booking Fee $6.16

Tip $7.00

Airport Surcharge $4.00

Payments

$43.61

$7.00

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with MAHMOUD

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.





 ANTOINETTE EDWARDS-April 2025  INVOICE   04/01/2025-04/30/2025  
DATE                         WHAT                          RESULT DURATION OF EVENT              BILLABLE HOURS TOTAL  HOURS

2-Apr CRC Meeting The CBPA Coordinator and Chief Deputy Attorney 5:30 - 6:30pm 1 1
[Par. 131] Heidi Brown provided an in-depth presentaion on the 

process and recruitment for the Community Board for
Police Accountability. The CRC held elections.The IPR 
director addressed a community member who alleged 
that he was charged with trespassing at city hall.
The director dismissed the complaint as being invalid.

9-Apr PCCEP Policy and Reform Subcommittee The subcommittee briefly discussed the viewing of 6:00 -7:12 pm 1.2 2.2
[Par. 151] "Alien Boy". A broader discussion will be shared at the

April 30th meeting. The drat for the PPB Annual report
has been released. The public has 30 days to review
and submit input. Stephanie Howard confirmed the city
 withdrew the Townsend Appeal to bring closure
for the family. The committee briefly discussed the City 
of Portland Settlement Agreement with the Journalist and
observers of the 2020 protest. The co-chairs reported 
that the city has paid more than $4.5 million in the
past 5 years. The committee will follow up with more 
discussion about this topic.  Another discussion point was the
PPB technology. PPB's drone policy is on their website.
Their was a brief discussion regarding the City of Portland
 Settlement Agreement with the Journalist and
observers of the 2020 protest. The co-chairs reported the  
 city has paid out more than $4.5 million in the past
five years.  Another discussion point was PPB technology.
Airplanes, body worn cameras, and drones. The Drone policy
is on the PPB website. The meeting was interupted as we received
the sad news of Dan Handlemans passing! Heartfelt 
acknowledgements were shared for Dan's dedication and
commitment to peace, justice and police accountability.
He will be sorely missed.

17-Apr  Meet and Greet withPortland The Lead Monitor defined the role of the Independent Monitors. 9:00- 9:30 am. 0.5 2.7
Chapter NAACP Political Action The PAC chair gave a brief overview of the role and 
Committee responsibilities of PAC. The youth PAC leader exchanged contact 
[Par. 231] information with IM. PAC graciously welcomed IM back to 

future meetings.

17-Apr FIT/COG Meeting The group engaged in discussion regarding mandatory 5:00 - 7:00pm 2 4.7
[Par. 231] "Ride Along". A FIT Officer appealed to the group to keep in mind

when making recommendations about "good behavior/bad
behavior" keep the focus on the mission of FIT/COG. We should 
continually as the question "Is it driving down gun violence?". FIT officers
 reported updates on referrals given to gang impacted 
individuals. It was concerning to hear that officers making the
referrals do not have access to the success of programs the
individuals are reffered to. There continues to be ongong  
conversations regarding STOPS.  A FIT officer reported an average of



 10 - 15 stops a week. PPB does use pretextual stops.
 A FIT officer stated  "I cannot ethically drive by if I have strong 
suspicion about an activity".  FIT officers paricipated in several 
community engagement activities with diverse communities.

18-Apr IM and PCCEP Manager A productive meeting, IM and PCCEP Manager to discuss the 2:00 - 3:00pm 1 5.7
[Par. 230] upcoming Town Hall event. PCCEP was supportive of IM 

using  their regularly scheduled May meeting  date to host 
the IM Town Hall. The next steps include confirming the 
physical location, creating event promotional materials and
building out the presentation and agenda for the event.

24-Apr Meet and Greet Introduction The IM met with District #1 City Councilor Candace Avalos. 9:00 - 9:30am 0.5 6.2
[Pars. 230, 231] The  purpose of the meeting was to ensure the Councilor  

understands the role of the Monitors and to initiate a line of
communication. The City Councilor showed great interest  and
knowledge about the Settlement  Agreement. Along with her
service on the CRC for police accountability. The Councilor also 
offered suggestions for locations to host the town hall.

25-Apr Town Hall Site Exploration Che and I explored several venues to consider in selecting 3:00 - 5:30pm 2.5 8.7
[Par. 230] a location for the town hall. The criteria for choosing the site was

accessibility for public transportation, bus routes, sufficient 
parking for in person attendance, virtual  capability,
and community centered. 

28-Apr IM and PCCEP Town Hall Meeting The IM met with the co-chairs of the full body PCCEP to listen 11:15 - 12:00pm 0.8 9.5
[Par. 230] and learn about their experience from the 2024 Town Hall. Clear

boundaries and roles were established between PCCEP and IM.

28-Apr IM  Team  Town Hall Logistics IM team member created a Town Hall Planning Tracker. The task 2:00 - 3:00pm 1 10.5
[Par. 230] included identifying  options for translation support, identifying a

note taker to capture the feedback and comments from the 
community, creating an RSVP list for those attending in-person,
selecting a facilitator, securing parking spots, secure food and
beverages for the event.

29-Apr Meet and Greet  with MAC and IM The Deputy Director participated in an in-depth discussion with 3:00 - 4:00pm 1 11.5
[Par. 231] the Muslim Advisory Council. IM responded to specific questions;

"What does the Settlement Agreement do?  What will we get
from the Settlement Agreement?
The members described their process of developing a trusting
relationship with PPB from 2008 to now. It was described as a 'matrix 
relationship'. "We don’t just 
complain we seek solutions and share common interest".
"We don’t just communicate we connect". MAC was proud to 
share the experience of being invited by Chief Day to present the 
 PPB and MAC model of  "Relationship Building".





(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
14, 2025
Compliance Assessment Review & Revision, Par 220

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
15, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 74, 75, 77

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
15, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 121, 122, 123, 129

$250.00 0.8 $200.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
15, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 69 - 77

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
16, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 115

$250.00 0.7 $175.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
16, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 74-77

$250.00 0.5 $125.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
17, 2025
Outcome Assessments, Par 222

$250.00 2.4 $600.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
21, 2025
Outcome Assessment Methodology, Par 222.

$250.00 3.2 $800.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
21, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 74, 75, 77

$250.00 1.2 $300.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
22, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 74, 75, 77

$250.00 4.5 $1,125.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
23, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 116-118

$250.00 1.6 $400.00

Time $250.00 2.2 $550.00



Terms
Net 30

(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
23, 2025
Compliance Assessments, Par 74, 75, 77

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
25, 2025
Compliance Assessment & Report, Par 116-118

$250.00 1.3 $325.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
25, 2025
Compliance Assessment & Report, Par 74, 75, 77

$250.00 4.5 $1,125.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
28, 2025
Compliance Assessment Report, Par 116

$250.00 2 $500.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
30, 2025
Team Meeting All Pars.

$250.00 1.2 $300.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Apr
30, 2025
Compliance Assessment Report, Par 220

$250.00 1 $250.00

Subtotal
Tax

11,475.00
0.00

Total
Amount Paid

11,475.00
0.00

Amount Due (USD) $11,475.00



INVOICE
Cori Lowe Consulting, LLC
1509 Cedar Ridge Dr NE
Albuquerque, NM 87112

clowe@coriloweconsulting.com
+1 (505) 553-3601

Bill to

Mark P. Smith
MPS & Associates, LLC Con#30008888 Eff.
07/01/2024

Ship to

Mark P. Smith
MPS & Associates, LLC Con#30008888 Eff.
07/01/2024

Invoice details

Invoice no.: 1016
Invoice date: 04/30/2025

# Date Description Qty Rate Amount

1. 04/03/2025 P216_team communication and collaboration 0.6 $250.00 $150.00

2. 04/03/2025 P216 Prepare, attend, and IMT follow up to FITCOG
meeting including PPB training.

1.9 $250.00 $475.00

3. 04/07/2025 P216_correspondence and SEI review 0.4 $250.00 $100.00

4. 04/14/2025 P216 Debrief of site visit, PRB, and PPB report
meeting

0.7 $250.00 $175.00

5. 04/15/2025 P216_ Meeting with PPB and DOJ for draft semi-
annual report.

1 $250.00 $250.00

6. 04/15/2025 P216 PRB case review 1.1 $250.00 $275.00

7. 04/15/2025 PRB 0.8 $250.00 $200.00

8. 04/17/2025 P216 review and comment for draft semi annual
report.

0.7 $250.00 $175.00

9. 04/30/2025 P216_Monthly IMT meeting 1.3 $250.00 $325.00

10. 04/30/2025 P216 Review of and response to semi annual draft
and correspondence review.

0.5 $250.00 $125.00

Total $2,250.00

















































Date Description SA Paragraph Duration
04/03/2025 Outcome Assessment Meeting Paragraphs 222-224 1.13
04/03/2025 Outcome Assessment Meeting Paragraphs 222-224 1.00
04/04/2025 Outcome Assessment Meeting Paragraphs 222-224 0.70
04/05/2025 Outcome Assessment Paragraphs 222-224 1.05
04/14/2025 Compliance Assessment Discussion with PPB Paragraphs 116-118 1.07
04/15/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 0.13
04/15/2025 Compliance Assessment Discussion with IPR Paragraph 129 1.00
04/15/2025 Compliance Assessment Discussion with PPB Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 1.00
04/16/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraph 129 0.37
04/16/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 0.23
04/17/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraph 129 0.50
04/18/2025 Data Mapping Paragraph 224 0.62
04/18/2025 Data Review for Follow-up on Compliance Assessments Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 0.65
04/18/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraph 129 0.27
04/22/2025 Follow-up Discussion on Compliance Assessment Meeting Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 0.67
04/22/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 2.00
04/24/2025 Data Mapping Paragraph 224 0.57
04/24/2025 Data Follow-up on Compliance Assessment Results Paragraphs 116-118 1.42
04/24/2025 Data Mapping Paragraph 224 0.45
04/24/2025 Definitions and Metrics for Outcome Assessments Paragraphs 222-224 0.40
04/24/2025 Definitions and Metrics for Outcome Assessments Paragraphs 222-224 1.18
04/24/2025 Data Review for Follow-up on Compliance Assessments Paragraphs 74, 75, 77 0.23
04/24/2025 Preparation for Compliance Assessment Discussion with PPB Paragraphs 116-118 0.38
04/25/2025 Revisions to Compliance Assessment Paragraphs 222-224 1.28
04/29/2025 Data Mapping Paragraph 224 0.43
04/29/2025 Data Mapping Paragraph 224 1.02
04/30/2025 Revisions to Compliance Assessment Paragraphs 222-224 0.50
04/30/2025 Revisions to Compliance Assessment Paragraphs 222-224 0.92
04/30/2025 Monitor Team Meeting Paragraph 216 1.33

Total Duration 22.5

Susruta Sudula   Independent Court Appointed Monitor                                                  April 2025 Invoice
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Invoice 10
Issue date: 05/08/2025

Due date: 07/07/2025

Bill from Bill to

Valencia Thomas MPS & Associates LLC

[Redacted] C/O: Mark P. Smith

Contract #30008888

ITEM TYPE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Service PPB Monitoring - Began FAR205 LP review - Par.

246 - 04/07/2025

1.20 USD250.00 USD300.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Completed FAR205 LP review -

Par. 246 - 04/07/2025

1.20 USD250.00 USD300.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Discussion regarding reviews,

reporting and assessments - 220 - 04/13/2025

1.10 USD250.00 USD275.00

Service PPB Monitoring - FAR203 LP review - Par. 246 -

04/07/2025

1.60 USD250.00 USD400.00

Service PPB Monitoring - FAR204 LP review - Par. 246 -

04/07/2025

1.30 USD250.00 USD325.00

Service PPB Monitoring - IMT Mtg - Par. 216 - 04/30/2025 1.30 USD250.00 USD325.00

Service PPB Monitoring - IMT met w/PPB to discuss

specified draft rpt Pars - 220 - 04/14/2025

1.10 USD250.00 USD275.00

Service PPB Monitoring - IMT met w/PPB to discuss

specified draft rpt Pars - 220 - 04/15/2025

1.00 USD250.00 USD250.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Responded to draft inquiries - 220 -

04/23/2025

1.50 USD250.00 USD375.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Review draft rpt additional

information - 220 - 04/21/2025

2.50 USD250.00 USD625.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Reviewed reporting materials and

provided requested information to IMT - 220 -

04/09/2025

1.00 USD250.00 USD250.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Reviewed requested draft rpt

updates - 220 - 04/30/2025

0.80 USD250.00 USD200.00

Service PPB Monitoring - Reviwed PPB policy  - 243 -

04/23/2025

2.50 USD250.00 USD625.00



Invoice 10              2

SUBTOTAL USD4,525.00

TOTAL USD4,525.00




