
 

 

  
      

October 2025 Invoice 

MPS & ASSOCIATES, LLC 



 

 

Invoice #16 – October 2025 
 

Contract: 

#30008888 

Effective July 1, 2024 

 

Contractor: 

MPS & Associates, LLC 

2108 N St, Ste N 

Sacramento, CA 95816 

 

Invoice Date: 

November 14, 2025 

 

Remit payment to: 

Mark P. Smith, Lead Monitor 

[Phone number is on file] 

 

Bill to: 

City of Portland 

  



 

 

Invoice Summary 

 

Breakdown of Invoice by Team Member 

Team Member 
Hours 
Billed 

Hourly 
Rate 

Amount 
Billed 

Reimbursable 
Expenses 

Total 
Invoiced 

Mark P. Smith, Lead Monitor 
-MPS & Associates, LLC 

78.4 $375 $29,400.00 $1,281.58 $30,681.58 

Russell G. Bloom, Deputy Monitor 44.0 $325 $14,300.00 - $14,300.00 

Brian Buchner, Associate Monitor 
-BRB Consulting, LLC 

- $250 - - - 

Antoinette Edwards, Associate 
Monitor 
-Edwards Consulting 

9.1 $250 $2,275.00 - $2,275.00 

Robert Fornango, Associate 
Monitor 
-F1 Analytics, LLC 

19.8 $250 $4,950.00 - $4,950.00 

Cori Lowe, Associate Monitor 
-Cori Lowe Consulting, LLC 

25.2 $250 $6,300.00 $2,185.37 $8,485.37 

Che Ramirez, Associate Monitor 
-Community Homelessness 
Expertise (CHE) LLC 

16.4 $250 $4,100.00 $1,051.48 $5,151.48 

Susruta Sudula, Associate 
Monitor 

11.0 $250 $2,750.00 - $2,750.00 

Valencia Thomas, Associate 
Monitor 

17.3 $250 $4,325.00 $1,763.12 $6,088.12 

Aggregated Totals 

 221.2  $68,400.00 $6,281.55 $74,681.55 

 

 

 

 

Running Totals 

Total amount invoiced during second year of Monitor’s term, up to and including current 
invoice 

$464,913.00 

Total not-to-exceed amount for second year of Monitor’s term $967,860.00 



 

 

Team Member Invoices 

 

Following this page are invoices from each team member, which include brief descriptions of 

services provided, hours spent providing such services during each day of the invoice period, 

and receipts for reimbursable expenses as required. 
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Mark P Smith's Workspace 1

Mark P. Smith - October 2025

 Invoice
 10/01/2025 - 10/31/2025

Total: 112.90 Billable: 78.40     

Date Description Duration

10/01/2025 Review compliance materials and prepare semi-annual compliance report

 - [Par. 220, Par. 226]

3.20

10/01/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

3.20

10/01/2025 Review compliance materials and prepare semi-annual compliance report

 - [Par. 220, Par. 226]

4.20

10/01/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

4.20

10/02/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.80

10/02/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

10/03/2025 Communication with Parties

 - [Par. 229]

0.60

10/04/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.50

10/06/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

4.40

10/06/2025 Communication with City

 - [Par. 229]

0.80

10/06/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.70

10/07/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.00

10/07/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.00



Mark P Smith's Workspace 2

10/08/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

3.00

10/08/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.70

10/09/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

3.00

10/10/2025 Meetings with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.90

10/10/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

10/10/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/10/2025 Communication with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.40

10/13/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

10/13/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.70

10/13/2025 Strategize community outreach efforts

 - [Par. 231]

0.50

10/14/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.10

10/15/2025 Meetings with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.70

10/15/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/15/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

10/15/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.20

10/15/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

10/15/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40



Mark P Smith's Workspace 3

10/15/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.60

10/16/2025 Manage Monitoring Team website

 - [Par. 231]

0.60

10/16/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

10/16/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.30

10/16/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/17/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

1.50

10/17/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

10/17/2025 Meetings with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

0.80

10/19/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

10/19/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.00

10/20/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.60

10/20/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.40

10/20/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.80

10/21/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.50

10/21/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

3.50

10/21/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.10

10/21/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.00



Mark P Smith's Workspace 4

10/22/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.60

10/22/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.20

10/22/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.40

10/22/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

1.10

10/22/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/22/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/23/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.80

10/23/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

2.10

10/23/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.00

10/23/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.30

10/23/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.20

10/23/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.30

10/24/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.80

10/25/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.60

10/25/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.90

10/26/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.60

10/27/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.50



Mark P Smith's Workspace 5

10/27/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.30

10/27/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.80

10/27/2025 Meetings with community stakeholders

 - [Par. 231]

1.00

10/27/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

2.00

10/28/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

1.10

10/28/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.70

10/28/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.70

10/28/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.60

10/29/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

2.50

10/29/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.40

10/29/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.40

10/29/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.80

10/29/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.50

10/30/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.00

10/30/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

0.80

10/30/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.20

10/30/2025 Preparations for town hall

 - [Par. 230]

0.30



Mark P Smith's Workspace 6

10/30/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.40

10/30/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

3.60

10/31/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

1.20

10/31/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

2.50

10/31/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.10

10/31/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.60

10/31/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.60

10/31/2025 Monitoring Team management

 - [Non-billable]

0.20

10/31/2025 Consider revisions to compliance report

 - [Par. 227]

1.70



‭Romel C. Diaz‬
‭Website Design & Maintenance‬

‬

‬

‭INVOICE‬

‭I‬‭NVOICE‬ ‭#PPM-0012‬
‭D‬‭ATE‬‭: 09/29/25‬

‭T‬‭O‬‭:‬
‭MPS & Associates, LLC‬
‭2108 N St., STE N‬
‭Sacramento, CA 95816 USA‬
‭Email: info@portlandpolicemonitor.com‬

‭F‬‭OR‬‭:‬
‭Website Development, Maintenance, & Technical‬
‭Support‬

‭DESCRIPTION‬ ‭HOURS/QTY‬ ‭RATE‬ ‭AMOUNT‬

‭Care Plan / Website Maintenance for October 2025:‬
‭portlandpolicemonitor.com‬

‭Lump Sum‬ ‭$200.00‬

‭TOTAL (NET AFTER ALL FEES)‬ ‭$200.00‬

‭Make all payments to:‬

‬

‬

‬
‬

‬

‭Thank you for your business!‬

‭Page‬‭1‬‭of‬‭1‬



Today's Date:
Name:
Destination City/State:
Travel Dates - Departure: Tuesday, October 7, 2025 Return Date:

NOTES

10/7 - 10/10: LAX to PDX - Roundtrip $400.00

Due to unforeseen, late scheduling changes, only partial reimbursement is requested

10/7: Rideshare - Airport to hotel $53.80

$326.78

First Day $64.50 $64.50

Full days are $86 (10/8/25 - 10/9/25) $172.00

Last Day $64.50 $64.50

$1,081.58

Consultant

Project Manager

Portland, OR

Total Expenses Submitted to be Reimbursed

 Expense 
Amount

EXPENSES

City of Portland Travel Authorization/Expense Report

LODGING

Per Diem Rates | GSA
FOR BUREAU USE ONLY

Submit copies of all expenses requesting reimbursement for except for M&IE per 
diem

TRANSPORTATION EXPENSE

10/10/25
Mark P. Smith

Friday, October 10, 2025
Purpose of trip: Trial and Site Visit

MEALS & INCIDENTAL EXPENSES PER DIEM - LIST BY DATE

Signature

Approvals

OTHER (List Each Category below)



Confirmation Code:
EXMMQL

Mark Smith
E-Ticket: 

Atmos Rewards#: 
Seats:   LAX-PDX       22D

  PDX-LAX       26D

Traveler

Flight Departs Arrives
Alaska 1315

Main (M) |
Nonstop
Distance: 834 mi |
Duration: 2h 24m

Los Angeles, CA (LAX)
Tue, Oct 7
2:26 pm

Portland, OR (PDX)
Tue, Oct 7
4:50 pm

Alaska 1291

Main (M) |
Nonstop
Distance: 834 mi |
Duration: 2h 28m

Portland, OR (PDX)
Fri, Oct 10
9:30 pm

Los Angeles, CA (LAX)
Fri, Oct 10
11:58 pm

Flight Total for 1 passenge 46.59
The VISA ending with ******  has been charged a total of USD $746.59.
Total per passenger $746.59

Airfare $666.04
Taxes, fees, and charges $80.55

United States Flight Segment Tax
Domestic $10.40

US psgr. facility charge $9.00
US Sept. 11 security fee $11.20
US transportation tax $49.95

 
Each ticket will be a separate charge on your credit card statement.
For additional assistance with your reservation, call us at 1-800-252-7522 for assistance.



YOUR RIDE TO 1455 SW BROADWAY ON OCTOBER 7, 2025 AT 4:58 PM

Outlook

Your ride with Abdirahman on October 7

From Lyft Receipts <no-reply@lyftmail.com>

Date Wed 10/8/2025 5:37 PM

To Mark P. Smith <mark.p.smith@portlandpolicemonitor.com>

Thanks for riding with Abdirahman!
 

 Visa $53.80
 

Standard fare (12.74mi, 34m 41s) $42.72
City of Portland Surcharge $2.11
Tip $8.97

Your trip

https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkjE2OhCAQRk8jO03xZ8GCxWz6GgaLYiQjrUEypm8_6end9-W9vBSiT5IFB4nWewQ1O7EFZ6WOmFmTRpu0I4qzTnYlpQ1lZFGCAmUlgAfQaNwUo_YSHciEhKvHwcD-yr3Gsk90VLGHrffzGvTXoB6Detz3Pb2FD3zlvlS-rvjNS0nBWOSEmUbSkEfjrR_XFeyI1utkHPAMIFqosf1M53TV0rfBwHm0vsdnOo-9ENfjWfrR_vs9tJJ4aUxczn69_2eK36D-AgAA__9GqFDw
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkjE2OhCAQRk8jO03xZ8GCxWz6GgaLYiQjrUEypm8_6end9-W9vBSiT5IFB4nWewQ1O7EFZ6WOmFmTRpu0I4qzTnYlpQ1lZFGCAmUlgAfQaNwUo_YSHciEhKvHwcD-yr3Gsk90VLGHrffzGvTXoB6Detz3Pb2FD3zlvlS-rvjNS0nBWOSEmUbSkEfjrR_XFeyI1utkHPAMIFqosf1M53TV0rfBwHm0vsdnOo-9ENfjWfrR_vs9tJJ4aUxczn69_2eK36D-AgAA__9GqFDw


Pickup   4:58 PM
7100 NE Airport Way, Portland,
OR

Drop-off  5:33 PM
1455 SW Broadway, Portland,
OR

Committed to getting you there safely, every
time

Every Lyft ride has built-in safety features like real-time monitoring,
emergency help, and tools like Location Sharing and Audio Recording -
so you're always in control. Learn more

 

Get help and more

Tip driver

Find lost item

Report incident

Favorite Driver

Dispute ride charges

Help center

Select 'You' on the home screen in the Lyft app, then 'Ride History' to view your ride
cost breakdown or get additional help.

To protect against unauthorized behavior, you may see an authorization hold on your
bank statement. This is to verify your payment method and will not be charged.

https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJyMj71u7CAUhJ8Gd7YOfwunoLjSlV9jheE4RmvWCEicffvISZE23YxmvpEmOo-R00COG41oQNzssDkCzldpPSARYtAUleSoyFrrV3XDITkBQnMABJBG2cl7idxY4NEEs6BhCvbX2rNP-xSOPOxu6700Jv8xMTMxn-c5XYUrZGIOewoPJubiP8fmV-qvcXtfmJwztebf6J4ik_-VNhTNGsYgYR0VahyXBfRoNMqoLNANYLhW77-Y-xNUXfb1MZWp5dQ3pqActe_-Gcuxp0D5eKZ-1O8n3dUU6V4pUCq9Xf5HDh9OfAUAAP__T71nkA
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkzr1uhDAQBOCnsTvQ-ne9hYs0vMbJeJecFTgQWDnl7SOSbkbzFcO5EBvRkg0GIgQbk35miww1-qXEmMgstBDPBmcTQJzMkXTLFmwwAATg0KexFEcGExjGijOh8rD-LH0rbR3rvuk1P3s_LuU-lJ2Und7v93iDe1R2Ksy9HcpO1jgEjM7GZE2MLnnQt3tscl3lUx6Nsw8ojEsdqoNl8BRomGcIAwZy7BNIBNBn3sr5NR7jtbX-VB6O_exrefGxr63Ktr9a38-_bz2fjeVxSpV29Ovu_1F_Z_sbAAD__8sWWCg
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkzr1uhDAQBOCnsTvQ-ne9hYs0vMbJeJecFTgQWDnl7SOSbkbzFcO5EBvRkg0GIgQbk35miww1-qXEmMgstBDPBmcTQJzMkXTLFmwwAATg0KexFEcGExjGijOh8rD-LH0rbR3rvuk1P3s_LuU-lJ2Und7v93iDe1R2Ksy9HcpO1jgEjM7GZE2MLnnQt3tscl3lUx6Nsw8ojEsdqoNl8BRomGcIAwZy7BNIBNBn3sr5NR7jtbX-VB6O_exrefGxr63Ktr9a38-_bz2fjeVxSpV29Ovu_1F_Z_sbAAD__8sWWCg
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkzr1uhDAQBOCnsTvQ-ne9hYs0vMbJeJecFTgQWDnl7SOSbkbzFcO5EBvRkg0GIgQbk35miww1-qXEmMgstBDPBmcTQJzMkXTLFmwwAATg0KexFEcGExjGijOh8rD-LH0rbR3rvuk1P3s_LuU-lJ2Und7v93iDe1R2Ksy9HcpO1jgEjM7GZE2MLnnQt3tscl3lUx6Nsw8ojEsdqoNl8BRomGcIAwZy7BNIBNBn3sr5NR7jtbX-VB6O_exrefGxr63Ktr9a38-_bz2fjeVxSpV29Ovu_1F_Z_sbAAD__8sWWCg
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkzr1uhDAQBOCnsTvQ-ne9hYs0vMbJeJecFTgQWDnl7SOSbkbzFcO5EBvRkg0GIgQbk35miww1-qXEmMgstBDPBmcTQJzMkXTLFmwwAATg0KexFEcGExjGijOh8rD-LH0rbR3rvuk1P3s_LuU-lJ2Und7v93iDe1R2Ksy9HcpO1jgEjM7GZE2MLnnQt3tscl3lUx6Nsw8ojEsdqoNl8BRomGcIAwZy7BNIBNBn3sr5NR7jtbX-VB6O_exrefGxr63Ktr9a38-_bz2fjeVxSpV29Ovu_1F_Z_sbAAD__8sWWCg
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkzr1uhDAQBOCnsTvQ-ne9hYs0vMbJeJecFTgQWDnl7SOSbkbzFcO5EBvRkg0GIgQbk35miww1-qXEmMgstBDPBmcTQJzMkXTLFmwwAATg0KexFEcGExjGijOh8rD-LH0rbR3rvuk1P3s_LuU-lJ2Und7v93iDe1R2Ksy9HcpO1jgEjM7GZE2MLnnQt3tscl3lUx6Nsw8ojEsdqoNl8BRomGcIAwZy7BNIBNBn3sr5NR7jtbX-VB6O_exrefGxr63Ktr9a38-_bz2fjeVxSpV29Ovu_1F_Z_sbAAD__8sWWCg
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJxMjkFu9SAQg09DdokGBhhYsPilX7nGEwmTPtTwEgFt1NtXqbrozpZtfU4h-iR54CDJeE-grBuegRVoY4xxWkpMC0lIHgGNj3Zjh3LIQYEyEsADIGk3xYhekgOZaKXFk9Cwf229xLxP61GGPTx7P5vAf0LNQs3XdU134Q6Fmvej9dz5lkoiAVlU1ilpLToNAuePXgT-rznxo_LK-ezDPX8Ubi2-8SOnoA1xom0dV4Rt1N74cVnAjGQ8Ju2ALcBQQ4n1fTqnVnJ_Cg3nUfseX-k89rxyOV65H_Xncg9_ce32v-TPoL4DAAD__1tNX54
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJxMjkFu9SAQg09DdokGBhhYsPilX7nGEwmTPtTwEgFt1NtXqbrozpZtfU4h-iR54CDJeE-grBuegRVoY4xxWkpMC0lIHgGNj3Zjh3LIQYEyEsADIGk3xYhekgOZaKXFk9Cwf229xLxP61GGPTx7P5vAf0LNQs3XdU134Q6Fmvej9dz5lkoiAVlU1ilpLToNAuePXgT-rznxo_LK-ezDPX8Ubi2-8SOnoA1xom0dV4Rt1N74cVnAjGQ8Ju2ALcBQQ4n1fTqnVnJ_Cg3nUfseX-k89rxyOV65H_Xncg9_ce32v-TPoL4DAAD__1tNX54
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJxMjkFu9SAQg09DdokGBhhYsPilX7nGEwmTPtTwEgFt1NtXqbrozpZtfU4h-iR54CDJeE-grBuegRVoY4xxWkpMC0lIHgGNj3Zjh3LIQYEyEsADIGk3xYhekgOZaKXFk9Cwf229xLxP61GGPTx7P5vAf0LNQs3XdU134Q6Fmvej9dz5lkoiAVlU1ilpLToNAuePXgT-rznxo_LK-ezDPX8Ubi2-8SOnoA1xom0dV4Rt1N74cVnAjGQ8Ju2ALcBQQ4n1fTqnVnJ_Cg3nUfseX-k89rxyOV65H_Xncg9_ce32v-TPoL4DAAD__1tNX54
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJxMjkFu9SAQg09DdokGBhhYsPilX7nGEwmTPtTwEgFt1NtXqbrozpZtfU4h-iR54CDJeE-grBuegRVoY4xxWkpMC0lIHgGNj3Zjh3LIQYEyEsADIGk3xYhekgOZaKXFk9Cwf229xLxP61GGPTx7P5vAf0LNQs3XdU134Q6Fmvej9dz5lkoiAVlU1ilpLToNAuePXgT-rznxo_LK-ezDPX8Ubi2-8SOnoA1xom0dV4Rt1N74cVnAjGQ8Ju2ALcBQQ4n1fTqnVnJ_Cg3nUfseX-k89rxyOV65H_Xncg9_ce32v-TPoL4DAAD__1tNX54
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJxMjkFu9SAQg09DdokGBhhYsPilX7nGEwmTPtTwEgFt1NtXqbrozpZtfU4h-iR54CDJeE-grBuegRVoY4xxWkpMC0lIHgGNj3Zjh3LIQYEyEsADIGk3xYhekgOZaKXFk9Cwf229xLxP61GGPTx7P5vAf0LNQs3XdU134Q6Fmvej9dz5lkoiAVlU1ilpLToNAuePXgT-rznxo_LK-ezDPX8Ubi2-8SOnoA1xom0dV4Rt1N74cVnAjGQ8Ju2ALcBQQ4n1fTqnVnJ_Cg3nUfseX-k89rxyOV65H_Xncg9_ce32v-TPoL4DAAD__1tNX54
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkj01uxCAMRk8DOyLzN8CCRTc5QC8QEXAaVBIiQJXm9hWtvPHTs2x_yQeXOFL03GjnDIiXpac_ECNKtQuuuYaAKOFlnJh6lqbZCxCaAzgAaZRdQpCOGws8mWh2Z4iC8j7GFXJZYr1o8ecYTyfyg4iViPXE8ixzYtrJkYgVbyLWlhM2ItbQRo4FOxEr5xq4BGOstewTn9oGC6yHA8eb5TvmhPdgtbGYRxi53nRu3i7sPXzhlpNX2mAyR2RRwsGU047tO2hmtJNJWcAXAG3-Cu17eZZ-5XESBfNQCXd6askRr3rnUdtfnOHnm1vDiPkZffJ_S3-8-A0AAP__mhZqxw
https://email.lyftmail.com/c/eJwkj01uxCAMRk8DOyLzN8CCRTc5QC8QEXAaVBIiQJXm9hWtvPHTs2x_yQeXOFL03GjnDIiXpac_ECNKtQuuuYaAKOFlnJh6lqbZCxCaAzgAaZRdQpCOGws8mWh2Z4iC8j7GFXJZYr1o8ecYTyfyg4iViPXE8ixzYtrJkYgVbyLWlhM2ItbQRo4FOxEr5xq4BGOstewTn9oGC6yHA8eb5TvmhPdgtbGYRxi53nRu3i7sPXzhlpNX2mAyR2RRwsGU047tO2hmtJNJWcAXAG3-Cu17eZZ-5XESBfNQCXd6askRr3rnUdtfnOHnm1vDiPkZffJ_S3-8-A0AAP__mhZqxw
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For complaints, contact Lyft at lyft.com/help. Emergencies and safety concerns may be
reported at (971) 232-6606. You may also report complaints to the Portland Bureau of

Transportation at 503-823-7483.
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Hotel Vance, Tribute Portfolio
1455 Southwest Broadway
Portland, OR  97201

Tel: 503-334-2167

MARK SMITH Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  :
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Marriott Bonvoy Number :

07-OCT-25 17:35
09-OCT-25 14:00
1

Tax ID :
Hotel Vance Portland  09-OCT-25  03:20  9999
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
07-OCT-25 RT815 Room Revenue 8.19
07-OCT-25 RT815 Rm Chrg - AAA 126.00
07-OCT-25 RT815 Convention / Tourism Tax 3.78
07-OCT-25 RT815 Occupancy Tax 6.30
07-OCT-25 RT815 State / Province Tax 1.89
08-OCT-25 RT815 Room Revenue 10.12
08-OCT-25 RT815 Rm Chrg - AAA 155.70
08-OCT-25 RT815 Convention / Tourism Tax 4.67
08-OCT-25 RT815 Occupancy Tax 7.79
08-OCT-25 RT815 State / Province Tax 2.34
09-OCT-25 VI Visa -326.78

Approve EMV Receipt for VI -  Signature Captured
Application Label: VISA CREDIT   
ARC: 00   IAD:     : 

** Total  326.78 -326.78
*** Balance     0.00

Continued on the next page



Hotel Vance, Tribute Portfolio
1455 Southwest Broadway
Portland, OR  97201

Tel: 503-334-2167

MARK SMITH Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  :
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Marriott Bonvoy Number :

07-OCT-25 17:35
09-OCT-25 14:00
1

I agreed to pay all room & incidental charges. 

For your convenience, we have prepared this zero-balance folio indicating a $0 balance on your account. Please be advised that any charges not 
reflected on this folio will be charged to the credit card on file with the hotel.  While this folio reflects a $0 balance, your credit card may not 
be charged until after your departure.  You are ultimately responsible for paying all of your folio charges in full.

Continued on the next page



Hotel Vance, Tribute Portfolio
1455 Southwest Broadway
Portland, OR  97201

Tel: 503-334-2167

MARK SMITH Page Number  : 3 Invoice Nbr  :
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Marriott Bonvoy Number :

07-OCT-25 17:35
09-OCT-25 14:00
1

EXPENSE SUMMARY REPORT
Currency: USD

Date                       room         Room Tax         Food/bev           Telecom               Other               Total           Payment
10-07-2025 126.00 20.16 0.00 0.00 0.00 146.16 0.00
10-08-2025 155.70 24.92 0.00 0.00 0.00 180.62 0.00

------------ ------------ ------------ ------------ ------------ ------------ ------------
Total 281.70 45.08 0.00 0.00 0.00 326.78 0.00

Signature_____________________



Russell G. Bloom: Portland16              1

Russell G. Bloom: Portland16
Issue date: 11/06/2025

Due date: 12/06/2025

Bill from Bill to

Russell Bloom MPS & Associates

[Address Redacted]

Portland Police Monitorship

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

10/01/2025 - Planning meeting re Semi-annual report drafting

(All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.20 USD 325.00 USD 390.00

10/01/2025 - Semi-annual report drafting (All outstanding

paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.50 USD 325.00 USD 487.50

10/01/2025 - Semi-annual report drafting (All outstanding

paras. and self-monitored paras.)

2.30 USD 325.00 USD 747.50

10/01/2025 - Semi-annual report drafting (All outstanding

paras. and self-monitored paras.)

4.90 USD 325.00 USD 1,592.50

10/07/2025 - Quarterly Update (Para. 211) 1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/08/2025 - Team meeting (All outstanding paras. and self-

monitored paras. and Para. 231))

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/09/2025 - Quarterly Update (Para. 211) 2.00 USD 325.00 USD 650.00

10/10/2025 - Meeting with Multnomah County Sheriff (Para.

231)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/14/2025 - Call with IG re Accountability Paras. 0.20 USD 0.00 USD 0.00

10/15/2025 - Meeting with Congressperson's Chief of Staff 
(Para. 231)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/15/2025 - Phone call from IG (Para. 123) 0.30 USD 0.00 USD 0.00

10/15/2025 - Team meeting re Town Hall (Para. 231) and

Accountability paragraphs

0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

10/17/2025 - Team meeting re Town Hall (Para. 231) 1.40 USD 325.00 USD 455.00

10/19/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

3.50 USD 325.00 USD 1,137.50



Russell G. Bloom: Portland16              2

10/21/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.50 USD 325.00 USD 487.50

10/21/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

2.50 USD 325.00 USD 812.50

10/22/2025 - CE Team meeting re Town Hall (Para. 230) 0.30 USD 325.00 USD 97.50

10/22/2025 - Meeting with PCCEP re Town Hall (Para. 230) 0.50 USD 325.00 USD 162.50

10/22/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

3.50 USD 325.00 USD 1,137.50

10/22/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/23/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

2.00 USD 325.00 USD 650.00

10/23/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

2.50 USD 325.00 USD 812.50

10/23/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.90 USD 325.00 USD 617.50

10/24/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report (All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

4.00 USD 325.00 USD 1,300.00

10/26/2025 - Drafting Semi-Annual Report (All outstanding

paras. and self-monitored paras.)

1.00 USD 325.00 USD 325.00

10/30/2025 - Review parties' comments re Draft Semi-Annual

Report and DOJ correspodence re document requests  (Para.

245; All outstanding paras. and self-monitored paras.)

2.00 USD 325.00 USD 650.00

SUBTOTAL USD 14,300.00

TOTAL USD 14,300.00



 ANTOINETTE EDWARDS-OCTOBER 2025  INVOICE   10/01/2025-10/31/2025  
DATE                         WHAT                          RESULT DURATION OF EVENT              BILLABLE HOURS TOTAL  HOURS

7-Oct ACLU Check -in with Director Sandy Chung It was veryrefreshing to hear that Director Chung is up to 10-10:15am 0.3 0.3
[Par. 231] to date and veryaware of the DOJ Settlement Agreement.

10-Oct Meet & Greet With Mult.Co. Sheriff Sheriff Nicole  expressed great interest in learning 9-9:45am 0.8 1.1
[Par. 231] about the DOJ Settlement Agreement. She also 

shared examples of working in collaboration with PPB.
The Sheriff looks looks forward to ongoing communi-
cation with the Independent Monitors.

15-Oct Meet & Greet" with Congresswoman The Field Representative described his role and 11am - noon 1 2.1
Maxine Dexter's Field Representative responsibilities. The Lead Monitor provided an over-
William Ross view of the Settlement Agreement. The Field Represent-
[Par. 231] ative requested and looks forward to ongong communi-

cation with the Independent Monitor.
15-Oct PCCEP Policy & Reform Sub-committee PCCEP Updates -The city council 6-8pm 2 4.1

[Par. 151, 231] heard presentations on extreme risk protection
orders, legal review of Oregon Sanctuary laws
and ICE related legislation.
PPB directives are up for review. The public and PCCEP
members can go to the PPB website to make comments
on each directive. Directive 0640.45 CRT is screens
and traines volunteer police staff. It is mandatory that
CRT show up for homicides and deaths including
 those that are resulting from police actions.
City attorney, Sarah Ames, explained the First Univer
sal Review process. The PPB captain of Internal 
Affairs talked about the Sanctuary city laws in great
detail. Max Sledge with the CURE Pacific Northwest,
reported working closely with the Dialogue Liaison
officers. He has worked in political and ideological violence
de-escalation since 2020, in Portland. Mr.Sledge is 
also working closely with the the consultant from
England, that was hired to work with non violent 
crowd control. Mr. Sledge stated, "I see a cultural 
shift happening with the PPB".

21-Oct IP AC Steering Committee with Mayor Mayor Wilson provided an update regarding the 4-5pm 1 5.1
Wilson Ice Facility and DHS. He reported the Governor and 
[Par. 231] the Attorney General are "side by side with me". DHS

made demands the Mayor rejected.  
The Mayor reported "not one excessive officer comp-
laint has been filed". The Mayor asked for support from
the community. When going  down to ICE  "show 
peaceful resistance". Community members asked 
how they could support PPB.  Community members
shared several examples of showing support for PPB.
The Mayor addressed  that the concern is
that the current administration has "weaponized the 
DOJ Settlement Agreement".

22-Oct PCCEP/Monitor Meeting The Monitoring Team scheduled a meeting with 2 -3pm 1 6.1
[Par. 230, 231] PCCEP to discuss the upcoming Town Hall. The IM

acknowledged the feedback and suggestions  
from PCCEP regarding the previous Town Hall. The IM
offered to present a walk through of our presentation
prior to the event. 

22-Oct PCCEP Full Committee Meeting PPB introduced  (5) Liasons that will rotate to attend 6-8:30pm 2.5 8.6
[Par. 151, 231] PCCEP meetings. PPB responded to PCCEP's 

Exculpatory evidence recommendations for Directive
032.00. Chief Day declined to accept some of PCCEP
central recommendations. Specifically the bureau 
stated it would not remove Section 1.3 which aimed to
define what does not constitute the "Potential Brady
Material". The Multnomah County Public Defenders
in attendance expressed oppositon to PPB's position.
A community member shared that city council just
settled a $300,000 lawsuit because the PPB and the
DA did not provide exculpatory evidence to the 
defense attorney. The plaintiff was told he was respon-
sible for killing someone but after serving  5 years in
prison he learned the person he supposedly killed was
actually alive and not dead as the police reported to 
the DA. The DA reported to the plaintiff in the 
settlement. The DA continues to not respond to 
PCCEPS request to meet with them.
PCCEP announced IM upcoming November 13,
Town Hall.

27-Oct  LPSCC "Meet & Greet" The IM was invited to be panelists for the LPSCC 1:30 - 2pm 0.5 9.1
[Par. 231] Council Meeting. The IM provided an overview of the 

role and responsibility of the Independent Monitoring
Team. The IM are invited to present at the January
LPSCC meeting.

Supported IMT in securing location for town hall.



F1 Analytics LLC

Billed To
Mark Smith
MPS & Associates, LLC

Invoice Number
0000021

Reference
Portland Independent
Monitor

Amount Due (USD)

$4,950.00
Date of Issue
11/03/2025

Due Date
12/03/2025

Description Rate Qty Line Total

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
8, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 3.1 $775.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
9, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 1.1 $275.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
11, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
14, 2025
Semi-annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 1 $250.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
17, 2025
Semi-annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
23, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 117-118 , 220

$250.00 1.8 $450.00

Time $250.00 3.2 $800.00



Terms
Net 30

(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
23, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, 75-76, 220

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
24, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 75, 220

$250.00 2 $500.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
25, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 1.7 $425.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
26, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 1.8 $450.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
29, 2025
Team Meeting, All Pars

$250.00 1.4 $350.00

Time
(Portland Police Bureau Independent Monitor) Robert Fornango – Oct
30, 2025
Semi-Annual Report, Par 220

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Subtotal
Tax

4,950.00
0.00

Total
Amount Paid

4,950.00
0.00

Amount Due (USD) $4,950.00



Cori Lowe Consulting
(505) 553-3601

Billed To
Mark P. Smith
MPS & Associates, LLC
Con#30008888 Eff. 07/01/2024

Invoice Number
0000001

Amount Due (USD)

$8,485.37
Date of Issue
11/01/2025

Due Date
12/01/2025

Description Rate Qty Line Total

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 2, 2025
P216_Review and comments for self-monitoring paragraph (86) after
discussion with both IMT and PPB.

$250.00 1.1 $275.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 2, 2025
P216_IMT discussion and follow-up with PPB for semi-annual report

$250.00 1.1 $275.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 2, 2025
P216_Semi-annual discussion with PPB and review of questions

$250.00 0.5 $125.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 4, 2025
P216_P86 self-monitoring review and feedback

$250.00 0.9 $225.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 6, 2025
P216_IMT for PPB site-visit meetings

$250.00 0.7 $175.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 6, 2025
P216_PPB site visit paragraph preparation and follow-up for DOJ
request

$250.00 1.4 $350.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 7, 2025
P216_PPB site-visit meetings for semi-annual report

$250.00 0.6 $150.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 8, 2025
P216_Debrief of PPB site visit meeting and IMT meeting

$250.00 1.2 $300.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 8, 2025
P216_Site-visit PPB discussion semi-annual report

$250.00 3.5 $875.00

Time $250.00 2.9 $725.00



Cori Lowe – Oct 9, 2025
P216_Site-visit PPB discussion semi-annual report

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 13, 2025
P216_Discussion with PPB and semi-annual report

$250.00 0.7 $175.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 13, 2025
P216_semi-annual report

$250.00 1.4 $350.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 14, 2025
P216_semi-annual report

$250.00 0.8 $200.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 17, 2025
P216_semi-annual report and comments by the Parties

$250.00 0.5 $125.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 21, 2025
P216_semi-annual report revisions

$250.00 1.1 $275.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 22, 2025
P216_Review of semi-annual report revisions

$250.00 0.5 $125.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 26, 2025
P216_Review of PRB materials

$250.00 0.6 $150.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 27, 2025
P216_PRB observation

$250.00 2.2 $550.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 29, 2025
P216_monthly monitoring team meeting

$250.00 1.5 $375.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 31, 2025
P216_semi-annual report revisions and review

$250.00 1.3 $325.00

Time
Cori Lowe – Oct 31, 2025
P216_semi-annual report revisions and review

$250.00 0.7 $175.00

Flight October 2025 Site Visit $866.31 1 $866.31

Hotel October 2025 Site Visit
Removed a meal purchase from receipt total

$847.44 1 $847.44

Ride Share
Airport to hotel

$49.62 1 $49.62

Flight Baggage $35.00 1 $35.00



one-way from ABQ to PDX

Per Diem - 1st and last days $64.50 2 $129.00

Per Diem - Full days $86.00 3 $258.00

Subtotal
Tax

8,485.37
0.00

Total
Amount Paid

8,485.37
0.00

Amount Due (USD) $8,485.37



Today's Date:

Name:

Destination City/State:

Travel Dates - Departure: Monday, October 6, 2025 Return Date:

NOTES

$866.31

Baggage Fee (one-way) $35.00

Ride Share (Airport to Hotel) $49.62

$847.44

First Day $64.50 $64.50

Full days are $86 $258.00

Last Day $64.50 $64.50

$2,185.37

Consultant

Project Manager

Friday, October 10, 2025

Purpose of trip: Site Visit

MEALS & INCIDENTAL EXPENSES PER DIEM - LIST BY DATE

Signature

Approvals

Flight

OTHER (List Each Category below)

Hotel

Portland, OR

Total Expenses Submitted to be Reimbursed

 Expense 

Amount

EXPENSES

City of Portland Travel Authorization/Expense Report

LODGING

Per Diem Rates | GSA
FOR BUREAU USE ONLY

Submit copies of all expenses requesting reimbursement for except for M&IE 

per diem

TRANSPORTATION EXPENSE (Airlines)

10/25/2025

Cori Lowe

https://www.gsa.gov/travel/plan-book/per-diem-rates
https://www.gsa.gov/travel/plan-book/per-diem-rates
https://www.gsa.gov/travel/plan-book/per-diem-rates


Cori, 
you’re all set. 

We can't wait to see you on board. Before you fly, view full reservation 
details or make changes to your flight online. 

MANAGE TRIP 

Confirmation code: 

NBAGVY 

https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=8229d0d8d9696e2da25324e31a26253682f6a399a255763143baf0c486485f5615f040672ee0e5e1644d8a42f6e770d3a54c0010fca388f74cadbb55ce05cd97
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=8229d0d8d9696e2d37e1f0141f056d92dfc3ddf472149d9f79162a4a6645d768599ee6f979034c4b0603e337e653623db49425e069e821ccfc2845e55dc7d320
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=8229d0d8d9696e2d0d1c1b9f8293b7a846123a754b716d2991319035aff41381fc5415f76287afaf06fe9b8589a56bc5f012b6df50ef1b77fd700d81637e5fd4
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=8229d0d8d9696e2d43bd7df839572ccfbbbf015a57b2fd4714e30f0ffb8715b6f4cfb2cedb3a6f9e3b3f6013bb02369bacc5e54a856269f72fd96b45cbc3b8ac


Alaska Airlines 
Flight 123 
Boeing 737-800 (Winglets) 
Passenger 

Traveler(s) 
Cori Lowe 
Seat: 29A Class: M (COACH) 

Mon, Oct 06 
01:03 PM 

ABQ 
Albuquerque 

Mon, Oct 06 
03:19 PM 

SEA 
Seattle 

Alaska Airlines 
Flight 3344 
Embraer 175 

Traveler(s) 
Cori Lowe 
Seat: 13D Class: M (COACH) 

Mon, Oct 06 
04:53 PM 

SEA 
Seattle 

Mon, Oct 06 
05:56 PM 

PDX 
Portland 



Alaska Airlines 
Flight 206 
Boeing 737-900 (Winglets) 
Passenger 

Traveler(s) 
Cori Lowe 
Seat: 29A Class: N (COACH) 

Fri, Oct 10 
02:30 PM 

PDX 
Portland 

Fri, Oct 10 
06:10 PM 

ABQ 
Albuquerque 

Summary of airfare charges 

Cori Lowe 
Atmos™ Rewards Member: # 362640541 
Ticket 0272117432428 

Base fare and surcharges $768.38 
Taxes and other fees $97.93 
Per-person total $866.31 

Total charges for air travel $866.31 

View all taxes, fees and charges. 

$866.31 to be charged to the AMEX card with number AX1005 held by Cori Lowe on Sep 15, 2025. 

https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=8229d0d8d9696e2d065416f35bbc72ad80549da480786d8a9623319195318ffd7ff0494cc137d16c9ccd634c04cc03d155059909ae78741d88192912449d5512


PORTER PORTLAND

1355 SW 2ND AVE.

PORTLAND, OR  97201     

United States of America

TELEPHONE +1-503-306-4800 • FAX +1-503-306-4801

Reservations

www.hilton.com or 1 800 HILTONS

LOWE, CORI  Room No: 519/K1      

Arrival Date: 10/6/2025  6:36:00 PM 

1509 CEDAR RIDGE DR NE Departure Date: 10/10/2025 12:28:00 PM 

Adult/Child: 1/0

ALBUQURQUE NM  87112     Cashier ID: CSOLLMAN1

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA Room Rate: 153.63

AL:

HH # 2574315228 BLUE

VAT #

Folio No/Che 390252 A

Confirmation Number: 3341367809

PORTER PORTLAND 10/10/2025 12:28:00 PM

DATE DESCRIPTION ID REF NO CHARGES CREDIT BALANCE

10/6/2025 TERRANE ITALIAN KITCHEN #12646 LHILL69 3267986 $47.00

10/6/2025 Destination fee Credits - COMP LHILL69 3267987 ($15.00)

10/6/2025 DESTINATION FEE DABO 3268638 $29.00

10/6/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3268638 $0.44

10/6/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3268638 $1.74

10/6/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3268638 $1.60

10/6/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3268639 $0.87

10/6/2025 GUEST ROOM DABO 3268640 $153.63

10/6/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3268640 $2.30

10/6/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3268640 $9.22

10/6/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3268640 $8.45

10/6/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3268641 $4.61

10/7/2025 DESTINATION FEE DABO 3270250 $29.00

10/7/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3270250 $0.44

10/7/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3270250 $1.74

10/7/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3270250 $1.60

10/7/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3270251 $0.87

10/7/2025 GUEST ROOM DABO 3270252 $153.63

10/7/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3270252 $2.30

10/7/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3270252 $9.22

10/7/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3270252 $8.45

10/7/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3270253 $4.61

10/8/2025 DESTINATION FEE DABO 3272211 $29.00

10/8/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3272211 $0.44

10/8/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3272211 $1.74

10/8/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3272211 $1.60

10/8/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3272212 $0.87

10/8/2025 GUEST ROOM DABO 3272213 $153.63

10/8/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3272213 $2.30

10/8/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3272213 $9.22

10/8/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3272213 $8.45

10/8/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3272214 $4.61

10/9/2025 DESTINATION FEE DABO 3274344 $29.00

10/9/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3274344 $0.44

10/9/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3274344 $1.74

10/9/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3274344 $1.60

Page:1



LOWE, CORI  Room No: 519/K1      

Arrival Date: 10/6/2025  6:36:00 PM 

1509 CEDAR RIDGE DR NE Departure Date: 10/10/2025 12:28:00 PM 

Adult/Child: 1/0

ALBUQURQUE NM  87112     Cashier ID: CSOLLMAN1

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA Room Rate: 153.63

AL:

HH # 2574315228 BLUE

VAT #

Folio No/Che 390252 A

Confirmation Number: 3341367809

PORTER PORTLAND 10/10/2025 12:28:00 PM

DATE DESCRIPTION ID REF NO CHARGES CREDIT BALANCE

10/9/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3274345 $0.87

10/9/2025 GUEST ROOM DABO 3274346 $153.63

10/9/2025 STATE OCCUPANCY TAX DABO 3274346 $2.30

10/9/2025 CITY OF PORTLAND TAX DABO 3274346 $9.22

10/9/2025 MULTNOMAH COUNTY TAX DABO 3274346 $8.45

10/9/2025 3% PORTLAND TOURISM ASSESSMENT DABO 3274347 $4.61

10/10/2025 AX *1005 CSOLLMA
N1

3275348 ($879.44)

**BALANCE**     $0.00 

  

Hilton Honors®stays are posted within 72 hours of checkout. To check your earnings or book you next stay at more than 8,600 Hotels and 
Resorts in 139 Countries and Territories, please visit Honors.com

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING TO STAY AT PORTER PORTLAND DURING YOUR TRAVELS! WE TRULY HOPE YOU HAD A GREAT AND 
MEMORABLE STAY WITH US! WE HOPE TO SEE YOU NEXT TIME!

CREDIT CARD DETAIL

APPR CODE 129069      MERCHANT ID SEE MANAGER         

CARD NUMBER AX *1005 EXP DATE 05/29

TRANSACTION ID 3275348 TRANS TYPE Sale

Page:2



Visa ••••6916
10/6/25 10:32 PM

6:10 PM | Portland International Airport (PDX), Portland, OR 97218, US

6:32 PM | 1355 SW 2nd Ave, Portland, OR 97201, US

Comfort     12.65 miles | 22
minutes

October 6, 2025

Thanks for tipping, Cori
Here's your updated Monday evening ride receipt.

Total $49.62

Trip fare $30.02

Subtotal $30.02

Airport Surcharge $4.00

Booking Fee $5.49

City of Portland Surcharge $2.00

Portland Accessibility Fee $0.11

Tip $8.00

Payments

$49.62

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with VIACHESLAV

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.

https://riders.uber.com/trips/b7e4ef25-9af0-4493-a961-c5bce8cc6681


    

 

  

Additional Purchases  
Oct 05, 2025  

Thank you for choosing Alaska Airlines. The following items have been purchased 
for your reservation.  

  

Traveler name(s):  
CORI LOWE  
Items Purchased   Ticket number(s):   Amount  
STANDARD PIECE MAX 50LB 62LI   0274425475045   $35.00  
 

Confirmation code: NBAGVY  
 

ITINERARY  

 ABQ / SEA  
Albuquerque, NM / Seattle, WA  
Monday, October 6, 2025  
Flight 0123  

 SEA / PDX  
Seattle, WA / Portland, OR  
Monday, October 6, 2025  

https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=1f84f84c900101348d78dd46af2568d429c31a942ad33882b340893573a97b0c95ee4386f39fed7cc1a6c4c6e0615ce58ebbc7ca17b79d8e506a5fd55390a0c3


Flight 3344  
 

Total USD:         $35.00  

  

This is an auto-generated email. If you have any questions, please call Alaska 
Airlines at 1-800-ALASKAAIR (1-800-252-7522).  

We hope to see you another time, 
Alaska Airlines  

            

  

  

 

   

  

Book  |  Join Mileage Plan  |  Contact us  |  oneworld® 
  

  For iPhone and Android. Get the app 

This mailbox does not accept replies. If you need assistance, please visit our 
help center.  

Why are you receiving this message? 
Even if you've opted-out of promotional communications, we may still send you 
emails with need-to-know information based on your upcoming travel or recent 
activity.  

tel:18002527522
tel:18002527522
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=c7d923b351722917066b98fd93d967104608183cf7cd9e328bfb0421dc9417ef207b188c8ee5f69cfdcc60e43ee1a1e77df2e137f6647c515816de442fb74fcb
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=c7d923b351722917a039380b9f0ec4712e5bd0ea1e5486c425a87913aa12cf3d9063cd2ed80595d00e54d0223d86fb26eb18aede327098c449dbb914141e5327
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=c7d923b351722917384d505c91b57d48842c0c66556d0a80777cf9321791d04f5ebfb62155b76525aaa505aa934a63c7878c45b0a524d64b5ed3c6dcfd6db602
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=e7dfeea2231fa7acef2206983616dbc3727f9659f7a00b46d095841839b8242a66fe8c9008c870c7350c221d8ec603c9abf2597930adcf64c3f1b5c05da9cb4c
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=e7dfeea2231fa7ac04f761306536976a7d8032885c55604dbd2905280955f8afc76fa4aa38582efc5607ec3f31194f31493f945f572a920d53cc214e35fbbd10
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=e7dfeea2231fa7ac91cf970b21e8d259b0a360d0b96145a50b7f832c2a472e2feba3b088ab6979a89160c564c6b9b51859a39d0e67637bc1ffaac529e2aca52b
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=e7dfeea2231fa7ac91cf970b21e8d259b0a360d0b96145a50b7f832c2a472e2feba3b088ab6979a89160c564c6b9b51859a39d0e67637bc1ffaac529e2aca52b
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=1f84f84c900101344529f172a47fdae1b665aa44e674d74be982bf5532c211fd8e5f44986ea60ff8cf1a61628052648e93a7d3f5486964caa27885fd23cdf547
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=1f84f84c900101344f877f146f2cc9eb8a9a4818a5e44de2c712a4d00e13af16f5cb71db314a2e79f123d94a54d1d34c6d7d68e9f8e021be3a463b2a1e4166bc
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=1f84f84c900101341172c0aeb3a220b1124b9ea858823cc5fcd2636b5cb64497c821578c7710a0b9e4a6621168e5df5e8268951023f4cdd83b928ac78b9dedb7
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=c7d923b3517229173a991f0f3c01673ac5f5a69b5afca23ff6cd58b4312c5b5ab582399cb540b1a5d151be8949e1da97ce5fe14f412cc11e525516adeab1faf2
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=c7d923b3517229175fb1196492840bd8813b9c4f6897088befafee3ffc5d947c686d8e96803514a4c0457831faff2bd2deea3770de918d8c7786a17a7e9fd8cb


This email was sent to corilowe3921@gmail.com. 

Alaska Airlines, PO Box 68900, Seattle, WA 98168-0900. 
© Alaska Airlines. 2025. All rights reserved. 

View our privacy policy or contact us. 

View in web 
 

   

 

mailto:corilowe3921@gmail.com
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=faf80c9bca3d99188d9057b77b5bb6e24811da40a4c822a001b914c5822fcf6bfc790a8db10b6af5b5f4a6f878e00045baa7277591c406a5ac1949a94cb602f8
https://click.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=faf80c9bca3d991866be0862aaf18f8552e05818826bbce07d91bbe0f3152b6d9f137c801962c250059d17d0f973820a4d662dfb1959613233260d4c1974eb37
https://view.email.alaskaair.com/?qs=65bc7a5870d5d50c4611460e8c7c4bb4104788dcd7478be6bd5607fa3cf1cedf804283b8f100f3a3df1badf7059362cf205e250b61ff7b945a35dabcb6379631795bcaa2fdb6dd10291f9fd4497555c3


INVOICE

PAY TO:

10/10/25
1.5 $375

0.6

Town Hall Prep Meeting (90m), Meeting w/Commissioner 
Jones Dixon (36m) Par. 230

5.9

Community Engagement Colleague Call (18m),Community 
Engagement Meeting w/Sheriff (48m), Emails/Comms (18m), 
Community Engagement Tracker Updates (6m) Par.230/231

10/15/25

10/22/25

10/23/25

Town Hall Materials Prep (36m), LPSCC Meeting (60m), Town 
Hall Communications Prep (24m) Par. 230/231/

10/28/25 Email/Communications (24m) Par. 230

1.5

$100

16.4TOTAL $4,100

10/8/25-10/10/25 Travel Reimbursements (Flight, Hotel, Rental, Per Diem)

10/31/25 Email/Communications (18m), Town Hall Presentation Deck Prep 
(72m) Par. 230

Town Hall Prep/Site Visits Check In (60m) Par. 230

DATE:
REF NO:
Page: 

November 1, 2025
014
1 of 1

BILL TO:

DATE HOURS TOTAL

$150

$1,475

2.1 $525

Community Homelessness Expertise LLC
15575 Los Molinos St
Hacienda Heights, CA 91745
213.494.0500

DESCRIPTION

10/17/25

PCCEP Town Hall Prep Meeting (36m), Team Town Hall Prep Meeting 
(18m), PCCEP Meeting (132m), Community Engagement 
Tracker/Email List Updates (84m),Team Emails/Communications 
(12m), Draft Report Parties Comments Review (72m) Par. 230/231

1.4 $350

MPS & Associates
Re: Portland Police Monitorship

Community Engagement Check In w/ LPSCC (12m), Town Hall 
Materials Prep (54m), Town Hall Colleague Check in (18m) Par. 
230/231

Team Meeting w/ Office of Maxine Dexter (36m)  Par.230

10/27/25 2.0 $500

Grand Total $5,151.48

$1,051.48

0.4

$375

1.0 $25010/9/25



Today's Date:
Name:
Destination City/State:
Travel Dates - Departure: Wednesday, October 8, 2025 Return Date:

NOTES

10/8 - 10/11: Roundtrip LAX/ONT to PDX $400.00

Car Rental $126.48

$310.00

First Day $64.50 $64.50

Full days are $86 (10/9) $86.00

Last Day $64.50 $64.50

$1,051.48

Consultant

Project Manager

Purpose of trip: Site Visit

City of Portland Travel Authorization/Expense Report
10/31/25

Jose Ramirez (CHE LLC)
Portland, OR

Saturday, October 11, 2025

EXPENSES
 Expense 
Amount

Submit copies of all expenses requesting reimbursement for except for M&IE per diem
FOR BUREAU USE ONLY

Per Diem Rates | GSA
TRANSPORTATION EXPENSE

Due to unforeseen, late scheduling changes, only partial reimbursement is requested.

LODGING
Due to unforeseen, late scheduling changes, only partial reimbursement is requested.

MEALS & INCIDENTAL EXPENSES PER DIEM - LIST BY DATE

OTHER (List Each Category below)

Total Expenses Submitted to be Reimbursed

Approvals

Signature









Courtyard by Marriott® Portland City Center
550 Sw Oak St, Portland Or 97204 P 503.505.5000
Marriott.com/PDXPC

J. Ramirez Room: 1411
Room Type: CKNG
Number of Guests: 1
Rate: $185.00 Clerk:

Arrive: 08Oct25 Time: 09:47PM Depart: 11Oct25 Time: 12:00PM Folio Number: 80463

DATE DESCRIPTION CHARGES CREDITS

Operated under license from Marriott International, Inc. or one of its affiliates.

Bring the Courtyard sleep experience home with you. Visit ShopCourtyard.com.

08Oct25 Room Charge 175.00
08Oct25 City Occupancy Tax 20.13
08Oct25 State Occupancy Tax 2.63
08Oct25 Portland Tourism Assessm 5.25
08Oct25 City Fee 2.03
09Oct25 Room Charge 185.00
09Oct25 City Occupancy Tax 21.28
09Oct25 State Occupancy Tax 2.78
09Oct25 Portland Tourism Assessm 5.55
09Oct25 City Fee 2.15
10Oct25 Room Charge 185.00
10Oct25 City Occupancy Tax 21.28
10Oct25 State Occupancy Tax 2.78
10Oct25 Portland Tourism Assessm 5.55
10Oct25 City Fee 2.15
11Oct25 American Express 638.56

     Card #: AXXXXXXXXXXXXX1008/XXXX
     Amount:   638.56  Auth: 104627

 This card was electronically swiped on 08Oct25

BALANCE: 0.00

Marriott Bonvoy Account # XXXXX8801.  Your Marriott Bonvoy points/miles earned on your eligible earnings will be credited to your account.
Check your Marriott Bonvoy account statement or your online statement for updated activity.

Follow us on Facebook - www.facebook.com/courtyardportland

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com.





Sixt Rent a Car, LLC
P.O. Box 8188 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33310 
United States

reservations-usa@sixt.com
customerservice-usa@sixt.com
Call: 1 888 749 8227
Fax: 1 888 722 2980
www.sixt.com

Check or Money order
Sixt Rent a Car, LLC
P.O. Box 8188
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33310
 
 

Download
SIXT App now

Invoice item

Tax information

Rental amount Prepaid amount 1 Invoice amount

Net amount 108.10 USD -108.10 USD 0.00 USD

A1 Rental Car Tax 17.00% 18.38 USD -18.38 USD 0.00 USD

126.48 USD -126.48 USD 0.00 USDGross amount
1 Prepaid with invoice 1088020002098687 from 10/09/2025

Payment information

Payment instrument Transaction date Transaction amount debited/credited(-)
AMEX  •••• •••• •••• •008 10/09/2025 126.48 USD

Total amount debited 126.48 USD



Date Description Project Duration
10/08/2025 Monitor Team Meeting Paragraph 216 0.9
10/13/2025 Compliance Report Review All 1.0
10/13/2025 Methodology Appendix Methodology- Paragraph 224 0.7
10/23/2025 Compliance Report Review Meeting Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 3.0
10/24/2025 Compliance Report Review Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 1.0
10/28/2025 Compliance Report Review Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 0.4
10/28/2025 Compliance Report Review Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 1.0
10/28/2025 Compliance Report Review Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 0.9
10/29/2025 Monitor Team Meeting Paragraph 216 1.6
10/29/2025 Compliance Report Review Paragraphs 74-77, 116-118 0.5

Total Duration 11.0

Susruta Sudula             Independent Court Appointed Monitor                     October 2025 Invoice



Invoice 16              1

Invoice 16
Issue date: 11/07/2025

Due date: 01/06/2026

Bill from Bill to

Valencia Thomas MPS & Associates LLC

[Redacted] C/O: Mark P. Smith

Contract #30008888

ITEM TYPE DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Service 10/05/2025 - Discussion Re: PPB Site Visit - All

Pars.

0.70 USD250.00 USD175.00

Service 10/07/2025 - PPB Meeting Prep - All Pars. 1.50 USD250.00 USD375.00

Service 10/07/2025 - PPB Meeting Prep - All Pars. 1.60 USD250.00 USD400.00

Service 10/08/2025 - Debrief and ICAM Team Mtg - All Pars. 1.20 USD250.00 USD300.00

Service 10/08/2025 - Meeting w/PPB Re: Draft Rpt. - All

Pars.

3.50 USD250.00 USD875.00

Service 10/09/2025 - Mtg w/PPB Re: Draft Rpt - All Pars. 2.90 USD250.00 USD725.00

Service 10/21/2025 - Review/Respond to Draft Rpt Par's. -

All Pars.

2.20 USD250.00 USD550.00

Service 10/23/2025 - Discussion Re: Draft Rpt. - 73 0.60 USD250.00 USD150.00

Service 10/29/2025 - ICAM Team Mtg - All Pars. 1.60 USD250.00 USD400.00

Service 10/30/2025 - Discussion of SM materials - 81 0.50 USD250.00 USD125.00

Service 10/30/2025 - Review additional SM materials - 81 1.00 USD250.00 USD250.00

Product 10/06/2025 - Flight - Not billing for business or first

class upgrade.  Billing for base rate only.

1.00 USD496.60 USD496.60

Product 10/06/2025 - Meals 1.00 USD64.50 USD64.50

Product 10/06/2025 - Rideshare Service - Uber from PDX to

Hotel

1.00 USD51.91 USD51.91

Product 10/06/2025 - Rideshare Service - Uber from home to

Ont Airport

1.00 USD43.96 USD43.96

Product 10/07/2025 - Meals 1.00 USD86.00 USD86.00

Product 10/08/2025 - Meals 1.00 USD86.00 USD86.00



Invoice 16              2

Product 10/09/2025 - Meals 1.00 USD86.00 USD86.00

Product 10/10/2025 - Lodging - Adjusted billing total by

removing the four additional charges from total.

1.00 USD739.20 USD739.20

Product 10/10/2025 - Meals 1.00 USD64.50 USD64.50

Product 10/10/2025 - Rideshare Service - VT and CL shared

vehicle to Airport

1.00 USD44.45 USD44.45

SUBTOTAL USD6,088.12

TOTAL USD6,088.12



Today's Date:
Name:
Destination City/State:
Travel Dates - Departure: Monday, October 6, 2025 Return Date:

NOTES

$496.60

Uber: Home to Airport $43.96

PDX to Hotel $51.91

Lyft: 10/10 Hotel to PDX (shared ride to PDX with CL) $44.45

$739.20

First Day $64.50
10/6 $64.50

Full days are $86.00
10/7 $86.00

10/8 $86.00

9-Oct $86.00

Last Day $64.50
$64.50

 

$1,763.12

Consultant

Project Manager

Portland, Oregon

Total Expenses Submitted to be Reimbursed

 Expense 
Amount

EXPENSES

City of Portland Travel Authorization/Expense Report

LODGING

Per Diem Rates | GSA
FOR BUREAU USE ONLY

Submit copies of all expenses requesting reimbursement for except for M&IE per diem

TRANSPORTATION EXPENSE (Airlines)

November 6,2025
Valencia Thomas

Friday, October 10, 2025
Purpose of trip: Site Visit

MEALS & INCIDENTAL EXPENSES PER DIEM - LIST BY DATE

Signature

Approvals

Oct 6 - 10: ONT to PDX - Roundtrip (not billing $636.60 upgrade)

OTHER (List Each Category below)

10/10

Porter Portland Hotel - Portland, OR
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